












Work Date Work Hours Narrative 
1/3/20181 0.25 1 File our motion for entry of judgment. Prepare correspondence to Marc and Alyssa regarding the hearing date. 

1/9/20181 
' Conference with plaintiffs counsel regarding the settlement offer. Conference with Marc regarding the same. Correspondence to and from 

0.50 regarding the same. 

1/16/20181 
I Receipt and review o: McFarland_ Real Estate's response ~o our motion for attorney f:es, taxed costs and interest on verdict. Prepare 

1.25 correspondence to clients regarding same. Conference with Mr. VanderVelde regarding the response and the hearing . 
I Receipt and review of correspondence from Attorney Edsenga together with McFarland Real Estate's Claim of Appeal filed with the Court 

1/17/2018 1 0.50 lof Appeals. Prepare correspondence to clients regarding same. Conference with Marc VanderVelde regarding the appeal. 
1/1 8/20181 1.50 I Prepare for and attend our motion for attorney fees, costs and interest. 

1/19/2018 0.251 Receipt and review of court reporter certificate of ordering of transcript of a portion of the December 5, 2017 hearing by Mr. Edsenga. 

1/22/2018 I 
Receipt and review of Court of Appeals notice to Mr. Edsenga regarding corrections which he must make within 21 days for his appeal 

0.25 lfi ling. 

1/23/20181 
Prepare appearance on behalf of Anderson Woods Condominium Association and e-file same with the Court of Appeals. Mail copy of 

0.25lappearance and proof of service to Attorney Edsenga. Prepare correspondence to clients regarding same. 

1/24/20181 
I Receipt and review of entered Opinion and Order Grant ing "Reasonable" Attorney Fees to Anderson Woods. Prepare correspondence to 

1.00 clients regarding same. 

1/26/2018 
I Prepare and file our order under the 7-day rule granting judgment in our favor and against McFarland Real Estate. Prepare 

0.50 correspondence to clients enclosing same. 
2/8/2018 0.251 Receipt and review of the entered order granting Anderson Woods a money judgment against McFarland Real Estate. 

2/14/2018 0.25 I Receipt and review of Court of Appeals notice regarding docket number assigned to the case. 
Receipt and review of order from Court of Appeals dismissing claim of appeal fi led by McFarland Real Estate. Prepare correspondence to 

2/15/2018 0.25 lclients regarding same. 

2/16/2018 
!conferences with Marc regarding the order from the court of appeals and potential collection actions. Conference with attorney for Lake 

0.50 Michigan Credit Union regarding the mortgage on the property. Review the mortgage and its $150,000 balance as of January 13, 2017. 

2/26/2018 
I Receipt and review of the newly filed claim on appeal. Prepare correspondence to Marc and Alyssa regarding the same. Conference with 

0.25 the attorney for McFarland Real Estate regarding the same. 
Conference with Marc regarding the appeal and the options for collecting the judgment and my conversation with McFarland's counsel. 

2/27/2018 0.50 Review and analysis of collection strategies. 
Prepare appearance for second claim of appeal filed by McFarland Real Estate. E-file appearance and serve upon opposing counsel. 

3/1/2018 , 0.25 Prepare correspondence to clients regarding same. 

3/2/2018 0.25 Prepare correspondence to Marc regarding the options in connection with the judgment and the appeal along with my recommendation. 
Prepare subpoena for documents to Lake Michigan Credit Union requesting information relating to McFarland's loan balance in connection 

3/5/20181 with our collection efforts. 
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3/8/20181 Telephone call from McFarland's counsel regarding my subpoena to LMCU and his indication that he would pursue a stay of proceedings. 

3/12/2018 Review issue regarding the plaintiff's claim that it will attempt to obtain a personal bond as part of its request for a stay of proceedings. 
~ I Receipt and review of signed return receipt for records subpoena served upon Lake Michigan Credit Union. Prepare proof of service for 

3/14/2018 I the same. Prepare correspondence to court filing proof of service. Prepare correspondence to clients regarding same. 

3/16/2018 
.:x Conference with attorney for LMCU regarding the subpoena Prepare document request to McFarland. Prepare subpoena to McFarland. 

I Prepare notice of hearing for creditor's examination of McFarland. 



Work Date Work Hours Narrative 

3/20/2018 

'XI Receipt and review of creditor's examination subpoena signed by Judge Yates. Prepare correspondence to Attorney Edsenga enclosing 
same. Prepare correspondence to clients enclosing same. Conference with Marc regarding the collection efforts and the vacant Jot 
perhaps being the sole asset of the LLC. 

X Receipt and review of McFarland's proposed order for stay pending appeal filed under the 7-day rule. Receipt and review of bond on 
appeal with copy of receipt from the Kent County Treasurer for $16,745.05 cash bond. Prepare correspondence to Marc Vander Velde 

3/22/2018 regarding the same. 
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3/23/2018 - ""':".~ I Prepare response to McFarland's request and order for a stay. 

X Receipt and review of McFarland's response to our objection to proposed order for stay of appeal and bond on appeal. Receipt and review 
of signed return receipt card for creditor's examination subpoena served upon Mr. Edsenga on behalf of McFarland Real Estate. Prepare 

3/26/2018 proof of service for creditor's examination subpoena and file same with the court. 
3/27/20181 ~ 5 1Receipt and review of the notice of hearing from the court regarding the objection to the automatic stay. 
3/28/2018 \ ~ Receipt and review of notice from the court regarding the hearing on the order to stay. 
3/29/20181 ~ 5 Correspondence from and to McFarland's counsel regarding meeting with Judge Yates to review the bond on appeal. 
4/3/20181 :::::::,egs Correspondence from and to the court clerk regarding the motion for a stay. 

4/6/20181 0.25 Receipt and review of order from the court of appeals regarding the Plaintiffs appeal and ordering Plaintiff to order the underlying record. 
4/9/2018 0.25 I Receipt and review of McFarland Real Estate's docketing statement filed with the court of appeals. 

4/10/2018 
~ I Prepare for the conference with Judge Yates regarding the deficiencies with the bond on appeal. Correspondence to and from McFarland's 

counsel regarding the same. 

4/12/2018 ~ I Receipt and review of the new bond on appeal. Correspondence from and to the court regarding the bond and the creditor's examination. 
4/16/2018 ~ Receipt and review of Order for Stay Pending Aepeal entered by the Kent County Circuit Court. 
4/20/20181 0.50 Receipt and review of the trial transcript for purposes of the appeal. 

5/10/2018 1 
Receipt and review of reporter/recorder certificate of ordering transcript on appeal for motion hearing held on January 18, 2018. Prepare 

0.25 correspondence to clients regarding same. 

5/17/20181 
Receipt and review of Court of Appeals letter to Mr. Edsenga regarding untimely ordering of January 18, 2018 transcript. Prepare 

0.25 correspondence to clients regarding same. 
6/15/2018 1.25 Receipt and review of McFarland's brief on appeal. 

I Review issues in connection with the appellant's late request for the transcript. Prepare motion to extend the filing of appellee's brief after 
7/11/2018 1.00 receipt of the transcript. 

7/20/20181 
J Review the underlying transcript in connection with the reply brief. Identify questions and testimony elicited by the appellant at trial that 

3.75 contradict its appellate position. Make outline of response to the same. 
7/26/20181 1. 75 J Receipt and review of transcript for the January 18, 2018 hearing on our motion for attorney fees, tax costs and interest on verdict. 

8/13/20181 
I Prepare section of brief relating to jurisdiction. Identify the various standards of review for the court of appeals. Identify issues to include in 

3.25 the statement of questions presented. Prepare summary of arguments made at the bench trial for use in the appellate brief. 
Preparation of additional sections in the statement of facts section of our appellate brief. Review and confirm the accuracy of the 

8/14/20181 
appellant's reference to the lower court record and identify factual inaccuracies. REview and analysis of legal standards for the 

4.75 determination and review of ambiguities. 

8/15/20181 
Continued work on the introduction and statement of facts section of the appeal brief. Review the lower court record in connection with the 

5.25 appellate arguments. 

8/27/2018 
I Prepare additional portions of the statement of facts section. Prepare additional sections of the procedural summary section. Prepare a 

6.50 portion of the leaal argument section for the appellate brief. 



\ . 0 
1,-~vl) t 

Work Date !Work Hours Narrative 

8/28/20181 
j Continued preparation of the statement of facts section of the appellate brief. Continued work on the procedural summary section of the 

4 .00 brief. Work on sections of the legal argument section of the brief. 

8/29/20181 
Prepare sections of the legal argument section relating to contract interpretation, ambiguity of the documents and decisions made by a 

4 .00 condominium board for the appellate brief. 

8/30/20181 

Prepare standard of review sections for two legal argument sections. Review and analysis of issues relating to the interpretation of the 
condominium documents. Review and analysis of the mutual mistake of fact argument. Prepare legal arguments in response to the 

4 .00 appeal brief. 

9/4/2018 1 
j Continued preparation of the legal arguments for our brief on appeal. Review and analysis of legal standards supporting the response 

4 .00 brief. ldentifv factual support for the arguments and factual summaries. 
9/5/2018 1 3.00 I Finalize the appellate brief, locate and attach the exhibits and file the brief with the court. 

10/1/2018 1 0.5o lReceipt and review of McFarland's reply to Anderson Woods' brief on appeal. Prepare correspondence to Claire Kryger enclosing same. 
12/21/2018 I ~ Review the proposed response to McFarland regarding the gates. Prepare correspondence to Claire regarding the same. 

W/20191 
Xsl Review and analysis of the timeline and question from Claire regarding the gates. Review the master deed and the condominium act 

regarding mortgagee approval and voting procedures. Prepare correspondence in return regarding the same. 

4/4/20191 
I Receipt and review of Court of Appeals notice of oral argument on May 7, 2019, at 11 :00 a.m. Prepare correspondence to Claire Kryger 

0.25 regarding same. 
5/2/20191 3.00 Begin preparation for oral argument before the Michigan Court of Appeals. 
5/3/2019 3.00 Continued preparation for oral argument before the court of appeals. 

I Prepare for and attend oral argument at the court of appeals. Conference with attorney for appellant indicating that he appeared at the 

' Grand Rapids location for the oral argument. Conference with clerk of the court of appeals regarding the fact that it is holding 
another/second hearing tomorrow at 10:00 a.m. Prepare correspondence to client regarding the same. Prepare correspondence to 

5/7/2019 4.25 appellant's attorney requesting that he let the court of appeals panel know that he appeared in Grand Rapids instead of in Lansing. 
Prepare for and attend the second oral argument before the Michigan Court of Appeals. Conference with client regarding the hearing and 

5/8/2019 3.75 the future handling of the matter. 
5/16/20191 1.25 Receipt and review of the opinion from the Michigan Court of AJ?Eeals. Prepare correseondence to the Board attaching the same. 

6/13/20191 0.25 
Prepare bill of costs, e-file with the Court of Appeals and serve same upon Mr. Edsenga. Prepare correspondence to Claire Kryger 
enclosinq same. 
Receipt and review of correspondence from the Court of Appeals Taxation Clerk indicating costs have been taxed in favor of Anderson 

6/26/2019 0.25 Woods in the amount of $170.50. Preoare corresoondence to Claire Kryger regarding same. 
7/8/20191 2.50 Preoare post judgment motion for attorney fees incurred on ap,eeal. 

TOTAL HOURS: I 83.25 


